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 TOWN OF OLD SAYBROOK 
 Harbor Management Commission 

     302 Main Street  Old Saybrook, Connecticut 06475-1741 

                         Telephone: 860-395-3123     Facsimile: 860-395-3125 
           
                               HMC  SPECIAL MEETING MINUTES 
                                              September 17, 2014, 7:00 p.m. 
                                  TOWN HALL 2nd FLOOR CONFERENCE ROOM 
 

  
  

 
 
1.  Call to Order: 
The meeting was called to order at 7:00 pm by Chairman Collins. 
 
2.  Roll Call: 
Present: R. Collins, Chairman, Les Bowman, Secretary, D. Cole, R. Goduti, G. Wall 
 
Also attending: 1st Selectman C. Fortuna; abutting property owners J. and D. Aldi; and M. 
Hansen  
 
3.  North Cove Boat Launch Regulations: 
Chairman Collins opened the meeting by offering a motion to establish regulations for the North 
Cove Launch facility that essentially mirror the regulations already in place for the North Cove 
Town Dock at Sheffield Street. The motion was seconded by Mr. Wall. Collins then opened the 
floor for discussion. 
 
Mr. Fortuna offered an overview on the need to establish regulations to facilitate future police 
enforcement activities to assure reasonable and responsible public use of the facility. He noted 
that there are currently no regulations in place as there are at other Town managed waterfront 
facilities, and there have been citizen complaints. Mr. Fortuna also noted that regulations are 
needed independent of the property line issues currently under discussion between the Aldis and 
the Board of Selectmen. 
 
Mr. Collins then opened the floor to general discussion. Mr. Wall asked several questions about 
the lack of enforcement of regulations at other Town facilities. Mr. Fortuna responded that he 
was working with the Chief to address this concern, and that regulations need to be in place for 
the North Cove Launch Area before he can follow up for police action at that site. 
 
Mr. Goduti then expressed his concern that establishing regulations before there is a firm 
proposal and final resolution of the property line issue with the Aldis was premature. He asked 
about possible deed restrictions if a “quit claim” settlement was reached. It was pointed out that 
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regardless of any settlement, the Town will still have the Launch facility, and appropriate 
regulations need to be formalized. Mr. Goduti also pointed out that he would like for the 
Commission to consider other uses for the facility. It was noted that was an item for future 
discussion. 
 
Based on the discussions, Mr. Wall offered a friendly amendment to Mr. Collins original 
MOTION that was suggested by Mr. Fortuna to make the proposed regulations effective subject 
to resolution of any property title issues. The amendment was accepted by concensus. The 
motion was then called, and the following MOTION was approved by a VOTE of 4 to 0 with 
Mr. Goduti abstaining. 
 
MOVED: That the Harbor Management Commission establish the following regulations for the 
North Cove Launch Area and to include “No Camping”, subject to the settlement of any 
currently identified property line issues: 
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4. Adjournment 
The meeting was adjourned at 7:26 p.m. 
 
Submitted: 
 
Les Bowman, Secretary 


